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ABSTRACT 

 
Background: Only 41% of eligible Ethiopian women completed (PMTCT) therapy in 2012, with MTCT rate of 
20%. 
Objective: This study elicited the perspectives of HIV positive mothers on the situation and the unique beliefs, atti-
tudes, cultural norms and individuals who have influence over them during their pregnancy.  
Methods: The mixed-methods parent study included community level surveys, focus groups and in-depth individual 
interviews of HIV positive women with a child at least one year of age in Addis Ababa, Ethiopia: only focus group 
and interview data are presented here. All tools were completed in Amharic with English translation.   
Results:  23 women completed in-depth interviews; 27 participated within 4 focus groups.  The greatest barriers to 
PMTCT completion were: feelings of hopelessness and carelessness, lack of understanding of the efficacy of ARV, 
and negative religious influences. The advice to improve PMTCT adherence most frequently offered included in-
creasing PLWHIV peer support and improving and extending current HIV educational efforts.  Participants rec-
ommended that PLWHIV mothers be utilized in all PMTCT planning and interventions in the future.  
Conclusion: Maintaining the motivation to adhere to the entire PMTCT cascade requires that a PLWHIV mother 
understands the validity of the steps she is taking and receives support for the many challenges she faces. Engag-
ing PLWHIV peers as active members of the health care workforce and expanding their use as educators and 
counselors is important. Health officials can consider these findings to develop innovative and effective PMTCT 
interventions.   
Keywords: Sub-Saharan Africa, PMTCT, women’s perspective 
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 INTRODUCTION 

 
Although HIV infections among children globally 
have declined by 52% in the last decade (Joint 
United Nations Programme on HIV/AIDS, 330,000 
children were newly infected with HIV in 2012 [1]. 
Mother to Child Transmission (MTCT) accounted 
for 90% of these infections, despite the fact that 
highly effective prophylactic medication for Preven-
tion of Mother to Child Transmission of HIV 
(PMTCT) is available [2]. MTCT risk is less than 2% 
[3] if a mother fully adheres to the “PMTCT Cas-
cade,” a process that involves maternal HIV testing 
and counseling, accessing anti-retroviral (ARV) 

medications at the time of diagnosis, adhering to 
medication usage through the completion of breast-
feeding, following nutritional and delivery advice, 
and testing the infant for HIV [4]. Although each 
individual step may be straightforward, trying to suc-
cessfully navigate all the steps in the PMTCT contin-
uum can seem complex and overwhelming to an HIV
-infected mother. As a result, only 62% of women 
were estimated to have achieved successful comple-
tion of the entire PMTCT cascade globally in 2012 
[1]. 
 
Failure to follow this complex system through to 
completion (attrition) is a documented challenge in 
Ethiopia, where an estimated 9,500 infants acquired 
HIV in 2012. Only 41% of HIV positive pregnant 
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 women/children pairs received the most efficacious 
regimens of (ARVs) required for PMTCT in 2012 
[1], and only 10% followed through to early infant 
diagnosis. Ethiopia’s 2012 MTCT rate was 20% [5], 
and the government has recognized the critical need 
for a significant improvement in PMTCT uptake and 
adherence. Reducing the MTCT rate to less than 5% 
and the number of new childhood HIV infections by 
90% by 2015, are stated goals under the national 
“Elimination of MTCT” (eMTCT) 2013-2015 plan. 
The plan also highlights a target to have 85% of 
mother-child pairs on ARVs by 2015 [6]. 
 
The focus of the Ethiopian government thus far has 
been primarily in increasing the availability of ser-
vices, and the number of facilities offering PMTCT 
services has increased rapidly over the last few years 
[5].  HIV testing among pregnant women has also 
risen significantly in recent years [7,8]. The number 
of those identified as HIV positive eligible for ARVs 
has expanded dramatically since the roll out of the 
simplified “Option B+” regimen in 2013. Despite 
these gains, efforts to improve the MTCT rate have 
been relatively ineffective [9], and attrition from 
PMTCT must be addressed [10]. Many factors can 
positively or negatively influence a woman’s ability 
to follow the PMTCT system through to completion, 
including systemic issues, social, cultural, and reli-
gious norms, peer and family relationships, and per-
sonal knowledge and beliefs [11-14]. Those unique 
socio-contextual factors which most powerfully af-
fect HIV+ Ethiopian women must be considered if 
PMTCT interventions targeting high attrition rates 
are to be made culturally and socially acceptable 
[15]. 
 
Recognition of the value of obtaining the insight of 
PLWHIV (people living with HIV) is increasing 
across all spheres of the global HIV epidemic, and 
their advice is being widely sought in program devel-
opment [16-18]. PLWHIV mothers can help to iden-
tify the critical factors which may be either beneficial 
or detrimental to their adherence to PMTCT, and 
their advice about how to increase maternal adher-
ence to PMTCT can offer insight [19]. In Addis 
Ababa alone, 70,000 pregnant women were eligible 
for PMTCT in 2012 [7], providing access to a wealth 
of opinions and experiences from which to learn.  
However, most attrition research in Ethiopia has 
been focused with mothers at antenatal centers, ex-
cluding the large number of women who fail to ac-
cess medical care during pregnancy. Insight from 
women who were lost to follow up in the PMTCT 
system in Ethiopia has also been notably under as-
sessed [10]. While researchers have suggested a need 

for formative qualitative research to understand the 
low uptake of PMTCT services and high attrition 
rates [2,20], much of the research to date has been 
quantitative in nature. To fill these gaps and inform 
the development of innovative program designs 
aimed at addressing PMTCT attrition, an exploratory 
mixed methods study with PLWHIV mothers in the 
community was implemented. The overall parent 
study focused on gaining a generalized understand-
ing of the beliefs, attitudes, and socio-cultural factors 
which affect PLWHIV women during their pregnan-
cies. The qualitative elements reported in this paper 
explore the primary influences that result in PMTCT 
attrition and explore, through the lived experiences 
of PLWHIV+ women, how best to overcome these 
factors.   
 
 

MATERIALS AND METHODS 
 

 
In order to explore and fully identify the reasons for 
the high rate of attrition from PMTCT in Addis 
Ababa, an inductive, mixed methods study was con-
ducted.  Qualitative methods included in-depth inter-
views, which allowed for broad elicitation of issues 
affecting PMTCT adherence, and focus groups, 
which facilitated the exchange of ideas between 
PLWHIV mothers. A quantitative survey provided 
additional information, and all methods were triangu-
lated in data analysis. This paper addresses the meth-
ods and results only from the qualitative research. 
The research project took place over a two-month 
period in Addis Ababa, Ethiopia. 
 
A variation of women representative of the demo-
graphics of the female PLWHIV population in Addis 
Ababa was recruited for the study using mixed pur-
poseful sampling [21]. Staff from two local 
PLWHIV support programs identified women of 
varying ages, ethnicities, religions, educational and 
economic levels, and communities to recruit. 
PLWHIV women who had a child at least one year 
of age at the time of the study were eligible and 
mothers of both children infected with HIV and those 
with healthy children were chosen. Women who 
were aware of having HIV during their pregnancy 
and those who did not know they were infected were 
each sampled, and PLWHIV mothers who were not 
involved in a support program were also identified to 
participate. These variations in sampling were chosen 
in order to minimize bias.  
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 Interview and focus group guides were developed by 
the PI in consultation with Ethiopian colleagues. 
These study tools were translated into Amharic by two 
native speakers then back translated by two other na-
tive speakers to ensure accuracy. The tools were pilot 
tested with five women in the population of interest 
and revised as necessary before data collection began. 
A trained research assistant conducted four focus 
groups in the local language of Amharic, and each 
group was digitally audio recorded. The PI observed 
and debriefed each session with the research assistant. 
Two focus groups included mothers of HIV positive 
children, and two groups included mothers whose 
children are not infected.  A total of 27 women partici-
pated in the focus groups, each of which consisted of 
six to eight participants.  
 
In-depth interviews were conducted in English by the 
PI; the research assistant translated to Amharic during 
the sessions. Interviews took place at PLWHIV pro-
gram office and lasted between 45 minutes and one 
hour and half each.  In total, 23 interviews were com-
pleted before the point of theoretical saturation was 
reached.   
 
Inductive analysis of qualitative data using the con-
stant comparative method was performed concurrently 
with ongoing data collection. Audio tapes of all ses-
sions were translated and transcribed verbatim and 
uploaded into NVivo software [22].  Structural coding 
of the transcripts was first done according to questions 
asked of the participants. Key themes which emerged 
as transcripts were reviewed were then written into a 
codebook before additional levels of coding were 
completed. Three reflexive sessions were held with 
PLWHIV participants to check the accuracy of find-
ings [23], and the research assistant periodically 
checked the analysis for agreement with local culture 
and customs. Four transcripts were re-coded to check 
accuracy once analysis was complete, and a data audit 
trail was maintained throughout the process. 
 
Ethical Issues: Approval and oversight for this pro-
ject was granted by the University of South Florida’s 
IRB, the Ethics Review Board of Addis Ababa Uni-
versity, and the Federal Ministry of Health of Ethio-
pia. Written informed consent was gained from all 
study participants before data collection took place. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

RESULTS 
 

Description of the study participants: The results 
presented in this paper reflect the advice offered by 
participants for improving PMTCT retention and the 
barriers to PMTCT adherence that they find to be 
most significant. Fifty women in total participated in 
the qualitative element of the study: twenty-seven 
took part in focus groups and 23 participated in in-
depth interviews. No significant differences in demo-
graphic characteristics were reported between groups. 
The average age of participants was 32.5 years old. 
Ethnicity was divided among Amhara (78%), Oromo 
(16%), and other (6%) groups.  The religion of partici-
pants was mixed between Orthodox (46%), Protestant 
(46%), and Muslim (8%). Less than half of the women 
(42%) were married, with the remainder divorced, 
widowed, or otherwise single. Half of the women 
(50%) had no education; 20% had basic (1-5 years) 
education; 22% had secondary (7-9 years) education; 
and 8% had over 10 years of schooling. Women with 
higher levels of income (defined as having 1-2 people 
living per room in the home) made up 36% of the 
sample; 50% had mid-level income (3-4 people per 
room); 14% had lower level income (5 or more people 
per room). The sample included women involved in 
HIV support groups (56%) along with those not in-
volved in support groups (44%).  
 
Approximately one third of the women (34%) had 
children infected with HIV. Of the total pregnancies 
for the participants, 46% had not been involved the 
use of PMTCT. Five women who did not utilize 
PMTCT and delivered HIV+ children had subsequent 
pregnancies during which they utilized PMTCT and 
delivered HIV- infants. Complete demographics of 
participants are shown in Table 1.  
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Table 1. Distribution of demographic characteristics of study participants 
 
 Characteristics Interviews 

 N=23 
Focus groups 
N=27 

Total 
N=50 

Age       

Under 30 26.1 37.0 32.0 

30-40 60.9 55.6 58.0 

Over 40 13.0 7.4 10.0 

Religion       

Orthodox 34.8 55.6 46.0 

Protestant 52.2 40.7 46.0 

Muslim 13.0 3.7 8.0 

Education       

No education 34.7 63.0 50.0 

Basic (1-5) 34.7 7.4 20.0 

Secondary (6-9) 21.7 22.2 22.0 

Advanced(10+) 8.9 7.4 8.0 

Income       

Low 17.4 11.1 14.0 

Medium 47.8 51.9 50.0 

High 34.8 37.0 36.0 

Marital status       

Married 52.2 33.3 42.0 

Single (unmarried, divorced, 
separated or widowed) 

47.8 66.7 58.0 

Ethnicity       

Amhara 73.9 81.5 78.0 

Oromo 26.1 7.4 16.0 

Other 0.0 11.1 6.0 

Completed PMTCT       

Yes 60.0 52.0 53.0 

No 40.0 48.0 47.0 

HIV status of children       

HIV+ 26.1 48.1 34.0 

HIV- 73.9 51.9 66.0 
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 Barriers to PMTCT Adherence: Women in the study 
were asked to share their views about existing or 
potential barriers or facilitators to PMTCT adher-
ence, either from their own experiences or from that 
of other PLWHIV women with whom they interact. 
A comprehensive list of these influences was gener-
ated from their responses and is reported as part of 
the parent study (Klaus, in process). In order to in-
form the advice given by participants for improving 
PMTCT adherence, only those barriers which were 
most frequently reported and generated the most dis-
cussion are addressed in this paper.  
 
Hopelessness: Hopelessness was the most frequently 
mentioned barrier to PMTCT adherence reported by 
women in the study: it was cited by 22 different 
women.  Hopelessness was expressed as directly 
giving up hope and was reported as women shared 
stories of how they personally felt “despair” and had 
thoughts of “giving up.” Some women even ex-
pressed “I desire not to live.” This theme was di-
rectly linked to the concept that HIV is a death sen-
tence for all who contract it. Although this perception 
is changing slowly, it was reported to still be fairly 
widespread and to affect adherence to PMTCT. For 
example, one woman stated, “the biggest thing is 
being hopeless. They have doubt about being able to 
recover from the disease.” Another shared, “It’s 
because they give up hope they don’t think they can 
live like people and make it.” While some women 
shared stories of others, others reported personally 
experiencing this hopelessness. One woman ex-
plained her feelings the first year after her HIV diag-
nosis by saying:  “I lost my hope and I did not con-
sider that I can live. I even lost my hope about my 
kid, also, and did not consider that I can live.” Ac-
tual suicidal attempts were reported by four partici-
pants at the time of their HIV diagnosis. Feelings of 
hopelessness also extended to a fear of death for the 
women’s children. One participant explained that “an 
HIV+ neighbor threw out her child’s ARV medica-
tion because “She has a mind that the baby is going 
to die, is not going to survive.”  
 
Concern about medication: Concern over the use of 
ARV medication was reported as a barrier of equal 
importance to that of hopelessness. Participants re-
ported that women frequently tire of taking a chronic 
medication, and they often doubt its efficacy since it 
is not completely curative. One woman explained the 
loss to follow up in PMTCT by saying “Another rea-
son they are not taking the medicine is it is too much. 
They are exhausted with it.”Another woman ex-
plained that “People are stopping the medicine be-
cause one, they give up on the medicine. . . . They 

say, ‘since we are dying, why do we take this medi-
cine? For how long will we take it? It is not going to 
cure us, so why are we taking it forever?’” One 
woman admitted that she frequently misses her own 
medication doses and stated: “I will tell you for my-
self. I was also hopeless one time. I still think some-
times the medicine is not appropriate, it is from the 
devil. I sometimes skip the medicine because of the 
hopelessness and I am an example of why people are 
not taking their medicine. A big thing is the medica-
tion does not cure.” 

 
Several participants explained that ARVs are fre-
quently thrown in the trash by pregnant women be-
cause “they doubt that the medication will work for 
them or either for the baby or the mother.”  Partici-
pants also expressed that many women have con-
cerns about side effects of ARVs and how they must 
be taken. One woman succinctly stated, “People are 
just misinformed about the medication.” Other 
women reported a widespread teaching that ARVs 
must be taken with food and how this hinders the 
compliance of those who live with food insecurity. 
Some women believe that taking the medicine with-
out food would simply be ineffective, while others 
expressed concerns over side effects being enhanced 
without food. One participant said: “People are not 
taking the medication because of balanced diet. The 
medication has burning characteristics in our body. 
In order to avoid that burn we need to eat good food. 
Most people don’t have foods in their house, but so 
they will avoid taking the medication.” 
 
Another woman explained that:”People are giving 
up on their medication, because they just give up. 
They say it’s too much. It causes irritation and heart-
burn, and needs to have foods with it. As you know 
people are poor they don’t have foods to eat, so if 
they don’t have anything to eat, they also stop taking 
the medication.” 

 
Even without food insecurity, fear of the potential 
side effects of taking the medication was commonly 
expressed. One woman said: “I am thinking ‘for how 
long will I take this medicine?’ I know that I will 
take it forever. But I am thinking whenever I take the 
medicine it will go inside me and stay there. So ‘how 
long, how long, how long?’ It makes me worried to 
take the medicine the rest of my life.” 
 
Other concerns: Other important barriers to PMTCT, 
which emerged less frequently in discussions, in-
cluded carelessness, a fear of stigma, the use of holy 
water, and poverty. Several women stated that the 
HIV education available on media, through clinics, 
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 and through non-governmental-organizations 
(NGOs) in the communities is sufficient for PMTCT, 
but that carelessness is causing many PLWHIV 
women not to listen to it.  One woman expressed her 
viewpoint by saying “People are passing the virus to 
kids because they are careless of listening to the me-
dia and doctors.” Another explained, “The teachers 
are there, but the listeners aren’t.” Another woman 
explained that “women practice carelessness when 
they go against medical advice.” One woman stated: 
“They get pregnant and only go to clinic to deliver 
the baby. Just carelessness, they only go to clinic to 
deliver the baby and the go home. They are just care-
less, even [if they would] tell the provider they are 
HIV+ and then they would be protected but they 
don’t tell them. This is carelessness.” 

 
Several other participants explained that pregnant 
women are careless when they are “lazy,” don’t take 
responsibility for taking care of themselves, or are 
“selfish” when they do not act responsibly in the care 
of their children.  
  
Stigma in communities was frequently mentioned as 
a possible barrier to PMTCT use. Several women 
reported having been forced by landlords to leave 
rented homes when their diagnosis was discovered, 
and others explained that neighbors often gossip 
about them. A few participants also expressed that a 
fear of discrimination from family members may 
hinder women from taking ARVs. Overall, however, 
several women reported that the level of HIV stigma 
has been decreasing in the last few years. 
 
Almost half of the women interviewed directly re-
ferred to the practice of taking “holy water” for heal-
ing as a common reason that women do not adhere to 
HIV medication or PMTCT services. They reported 
that many women are encouraged by Orthodox 
neighbors and religious communities to discontinue 
their ARVS when they drink holy water as a sign of 
faith.  One woman explained: “If they need the heal-
ing, they have to leave the medication behind. When 
people are going to get the holy water they have to 
leave the medication. They are not allowed to take 
it.” Although they reported that the necessity of dis-
continuing medicine is not officially taught by Ortho-
dox priests, many participants either had done so 
personally at one time or knew others who had. Sev-
eral women described having seen women die as a 
result of this practice. 
 
Although ARVs are available without charge to preg-
nant Ethiopian women, several participants ex-
pressed that stark poverty is a significant limitation 

to PMTCT adherence. Not only does food insecurity 
hinder the ability of women to take ARVs, but several 
women reported having been forced to beg at times 
for food.  Some women expressed concerns over diffi-
culty finding shelter, while others stated that having to 
work long hours for others hindered their ability to 
follow through with medical care. Some women noted 
a search for employment took away the time they 
could use for medical care, while others noted that 
being impoverished limited the strength they had to 
care for their children well. 
 
Advice to Improve PMTCT: As participants were 
asked about barriers to adherence to PMTCT, they 
were also asked their thoughts about what could be 
done to increase PMTCT retention.  Through sharing 
opinions and advice that developed out of their own 
experiences, participants expressed the need for en-
hanced education and the implementation of govern-
ment level interventions. Further, they stressed the 
importance of including PLWHIV in all efforts to 
enhance knowledge of HIV and adherence to proto-
cols.  
 
Enhancing education: Enhancing educational and 
counseling efforts was reported as vital to increasing 
adherence to PMTCT protocols. One woman ex-
pressed that “without knowledge and education, no 
one will take HIV medication.”  Women stated that 
much more information is needed about the impor-
tance of taking ARVs and how to manage medication 
side effects if they occur. One participant addressed 
this by saying: 
 
At the clinic, the clinic workers should tell the patients 
to understand the medicine. To discuss deeply to un-
derstand the medicine. If you tell the person the im-
portance of the medicine, they will take it, but the 
most important thing is for them to understand, the 
teaching. One woman shared her own personal story 
of how education had changed her thoughts and be-
haviors in regards to stigma and taking medication 
adherence. She described her experience by saying:  
“My view is at the beginning that HIV can be trans-
mitted by sharing somebody’s food and I was so 
afraid and I was disappointed and so I was afraid of 
going to the people or telling people about this stuff. 
But at the end from the media I learned a lot and tak-
ing the medicine is important even if I am at work. So 
I do this, take the medication during work when it is 
time to take it.” 
 
Many women expressed having had positive interac-
tions with health care workers and their high level of 
confidence in educational messages when they are 
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 offered by a clinician.  Women also suggested that 
effective education could come through several dif-
ferent avenues, in addition to the teaching offered by 
health care workers in clinical settings. One possible 
method of education, which was controversial among 
participants, was that of media. Two women said that 
media is the next best vehicle for education after 
listening to medical providers; a few said that televi-
sion (TV) and radio programs are helpful for generat-
ing overall awareness of HIV and PMTCT. Several 
said that TV should absolutely be used for “such 
important things” as teaching about HIV and 
PMTCT, rather than just as “mindless entertain-
ment.” Yet, other participants argued that education 
through media is already available but is not suffi-
cient. Some said that many women do not listen to 
the media messages, and another said that education 
from the media is not taken seriously.   
 
Participants noted a need to offer educational mes-
sages which focus on the benefit of PMTCT to their 
children. They suggested that ensuring women un-
derstand that children of an HIV+ mother can truly 
grow up and live healthy lives offers hope to adhere 
to PMTCT therapy. Ten women also suggested that 
issues of faith should also be presented in educa-
tional messages. Six of these women noted that hav-
ing hope in God can facilitate medication adherence 
and should be encouraged within education. One 
stated that her desire for the future is to tell all 
PLWHIV women: There is hope. People can live 
with HIV if they take medication appropriately. The 
first thing we should do is trust in God and then to 
take the medication. The medicine does not hurt at 
all. To take the medicine as prescribed and to have 
hope are useful. Tell the people there is hope always.  

 
Two participants wanted to advise women that they 
can take holy water, but that they must also be re-
sponsible for their children by taking ARVs. One 
expressed this idea when she stated her advice to 
PLWHIV peers: “I think God gave us [a] way out of 
perishing and we should use it.  Faith has nothing to 
do with taking medicine or not, [you] need to be edu-
cated about importance of medication. Since [you] 
have faith [you] should take both medicine and holy 
water. That's why people die.” 
 
Several women from each of the three predominant 
faiths (Orthodox, Protestant, and Muslim) suggested 
that it would be helpful to have more HIV education 
in their religious communities, particularly if taught 
by a leader. One explained that if a religious leader 
would teach about PMTCT, the people would be 
likely to “open their ears and listen.” Some women 

expressed personally having found it helpful to at-
tend the HIV educational gatherings that are held in a 
few large Protestant churches in the city.  They re-
ported that the education is not being brought before 
the larger congregations, however, and none of the 
Muslim or Orthodox participants had experience 
with HIV education within their religious communi-
ties. “It is good if a pastor talks about HIV,” said 
one Protestant participant.” A Muslim participant 
stated that “having any sort of HIV education in the 
mosque would be helpful”, and several Orthodox 
women expressed the need for teaching explicitly 
about ARVs and holy water.   One participant sum-
marized her advice by saying “I would just tell them 
to accept it [PMTCT] according to each faith. Every 
single religious institution should educate the peo-
ple.”   
 
Implementation of government sponsored interven-
tions: Women in focus groups were asked specifi-
cally what they wanted to tell the government about 
how to better control the transmission of HIV to chil-
dren.  Several women expressed their belief that it is 
ultimately the government’s responsibility to provide 
more widely distributed education about HIV and 
PMTCT, especially to impoverished communities. 
Stronger legal action against discrimination was 
mentioned by several, and one said that they should 
be responsible for educating the public that PLWHIV 
are equal members of society. Assistance in over-
coming poverty was requested by several partici-
pants: they suggested that the government create job 
opportunities for women with HIV, offer food subsi-
dies, and provide them with housing. While a few 
women made the optimistic suggestion of “finding a 
vaccine and distributing it nationwide,” others simply 
requested stronger support and encouragement for 
medical adherence. Many who asked for this support 
and increased education explicitly suggested that it 
should come through PLWHIV counselors.  
 
Involving PLWHIV peers: The recommendation to 
involve PLWHIV in PMTCT interventions was 
given by 24 different participants; this was over 
twice the number of times that any other idea was 
suggested. Expressing the common thought that 
PLWHIV should be more effectively utilized, one 
woman advised that: “The government should assign 
trainer mothers who are living with HIV already.” It 
was suggested that PLWHIV women can function 
well as peer models and volunteer social workers, 
and they can also function as links to community and 
religious engagement in HIV care. Their role in edu-
cation was also described by several participants as 
vital.   
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 Many of the women attested to having personally 
benefitted from interactions with other PLWHIV 
women, stating their peers had encouraged them, 
offered them hope, set good examples, and taught 
each other well.  When asked who supported her 
during her pregnancy, one woman said, “I have a 
friend also diagnosed with HIV who is the one who 
encourages me to go to clinic and take care of my-
self. She is the one.” Several said PLWHIV peers are 
those who provide the critical emotional support 
needed to cope with the challenges of chronic medi-
cation use. Three participants stated that they had 
given up hope in taking their medicine in the past, 
but a PLWHIV peer had actually helped them to 
change their minds and start taking the medicine 
again. A woman explained, “During this pregnancy, 
I had almost given up on medicine and almost 
stopped. But my friend says “see I am taking the 
medicine, why will you stop? Please keep taking the 
medicine!  That is what she always tells me.” Others 
expressed that PLWHIV peers are helpful in the 
practical challenges of taking ARVS, as well: a few 
said that a PLWHIV peer keeps them accountable to 
taking their medication each day by calling, texting a 
reminder, or visiting their home.   
 
In addition to offering advice and hope through per-
sonal interactions, participants expressed that 
PLWHIV women can be helpful in official capacities 
as clinic workers, educators, and counselors. One 
participant recommended that PLWHIV women 
should be hired in every clinic to track all PLWHIV 
pregnant women through their pregnancies. Others 
agreed that PLWHIV women should be prioritized to 
be hired as part of the healthcare workforce. 
 
The majority of women who expressed a need for 
increased PMTCT education agreed that PLWHIV 
women would be the best teachers in any context and 
preferable to community leaders, religious leaders, or 
NGO workers. They explained the importance of 
using PLWHIV educators by noting how they can 
add elements of personal modeling and peer encour-
agement to education. One woman stated, “Someone 
who lives with the virus should teach, because that 
person can be good example to others.” “If a patient 
tells them about it, people would be more willing to 
learn about it,” said another participant. Another 
stated that “[an educator] should be a person with 
HIV to be a good counselor also.”  
 
Many said that PLWHIV should teach in both ante-
natal and general health care clinics, explaining that 
peer educators are capable of offering more clearly 
understood education than health care workers. Some 

women suggested sending PLWHIV educators to 
religious communities to hold classes, while many 
suggested using PLWHIV educators in communities 
to teach classes or hold coffee ceremonies.  
 
Holding coffee ceremonies in communities or in in-
dividual homes is a very common Ethiopian custom, 
the women explained, and they are occasions in 
which “you can invite everyone and raise aware-
ness.”  One woman expressed that: “TV and radio 
are ok, but it [education] is better in the community. 
Like a coffee talk.  We go door to door in a culture, 
and ask people for coffee. If we live here, we make 
coffee and ask people to come. We do not tell them it 
is for HIV, just coffee, then we talk.” 

 
 Several participants suggested that those who gather 
for coffee ceremonies would take educational mes-
sages from that experience more seriously than they 
will from media messages, and a few referenced hav-
ing personally learned a lot from attending coffee 
ceremonies offered by NGO programs. Two women 
stated that they are actively engaged in organizing 
coffee ceremonies in their own communities for the 
purpose of teaching about HIV and that the gather-
ings are always very beneficial to those who attend. 
 
Some women suggested that coffee ceremonies 
should take place as small gatherings in individual 
homes, in which case participation is encouraged, 
personal support is offered and education can be 
more extensive. Other women affirmed the value of 
having larger coffee ceremony sessions in the com-
munities, even extending invitations to individuals 
who are not HIV+. One participant noted that this 
method will raise interest: “Most [women] will come 
out for coffee then will go home with awareness of 
the [HIV] virus. I think this is the best way to reach.” 
 
Frequent suggestions were also made that women are 
effective as peer mentors and counselors who make 
home visits to other PLWHIV. Several women who 
are currently engaged in the practice of making home 
visits reported receiving great satisfaction from their 
roles. They stated that they like having the opportu-
nity to offer counsel and “give a model example.”  
One counselor expressed what she enjoys about her 
volunteer work by saying, “I like going house to 
house serving people, visiting people, seeing the peo-
ple hopeless in bed and encouraging them. This is 
what I like the most.” Another peer counselor said 
she enjoys her work because “by making them a kind 
of service, bringing it to them, it is possible to help 
them.”  Another woman who previously volunteered 
worked as a home based counselor explained from 
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 her experience the impact such visits can have: “I am 
one of the examples to the people to go to clinic and 
get medicine every 3 months. I tell them my life and 
my story. The people, now, they always tell me be-
cause of you we are living today. . . .There are 10 or 
11 people now who are taking their medicine.” 

 
Women who were not personally engaged in peer 
counseling also affirmed the value of PLWHIV 
women making home based visits. They suggested 
that such visits offer opportunities to provide in-
depth education, to model how to take ARVs prop-
erly, and to check on medication adherence. Several 
women expressed that home visits can offer great 
personal emotional encouragement to PLWHIV 
peers. One participant who did not utilize PMTCT 
has a child who was infected with HIV during preg-
nancy. When she was asked what may have helped 
her to obtain PMTCT services if she had a second 
chance, she said: “I may have [taken medicine] if 
someone would have come and visited me about this 
[and showed] caring. And I would have gotten tested 
earlier.”   
 
Many women expressed a desire that home-based 
PLWHIV counseling and education programs be 
greatly expanded. They noted that a few NGOs cur-
rently offer programs which include home visits, but 
that they are limited in scope and reach very few 
women overall. Almost all of the women in the study 
expressed a personal desire to help their peers, and 
many of them said that they would be happy to per-
sonally be more actively engaged in offering 
PLWHIV support as educators or peer counselors. 
 
  

DISCUSSION 
 
 
While attrition from the PMTCT system in Ethiopia 
is a well-documented issue, the exact significance of 
each influence that affects a woman’s ability to com-
plete the PMTCT cascade is not well understood. To 
better understand how the most significant barriers 
leading to attrition can be overcome, this study ex-
plored the lived experiences of PLWHIV mothers in 
Addis Ababa. It also sought to bridge the gap be-
tween knowledge and practice, empowering 
PLWHIV women to guide future implementation 
efforts by allowing their voices and opinions to be 
heard. 
 
Results from this study suggest that overcoming 
hopelessness among PLWHIV women and providing 
better education about vital factors affecting the use 

of ARVs must be addressed if more women are to 
effectively complete the PMTCT cascade.  The study 
also demonstrated that these concerns, along with 
issues of carelessness, stigma, and poverty, could be 
addressed by the use of PLWHIV women as educa-
tors and peer counselors and thereby facilitate 
PMTCT adherence.  
 
The eMTCT plan for Ethiopia for 2013-2015 con-
tains goals targeted to improving PMTCT services at 
multiple levels, yet findings from this study suggest 
that a different focus may be necessary [6]. Although 
the plan recognizes the key demand-side challenges 
of missed opportunities for service and the high attri-
tion rate from PMTCT care, the majority of the 
plan’s goals and objectives are focused on improving 
the PMTCT system from within.  However, in con-
trast to many studies which document low quality 
health care services or poor interactions with HCWas 
common reasons for PMTCT attrition [13-14, 24-
25], most women in this study described having very 
positive, encouraging experiences within the health 
care system and a high degree of trust in the advice 
they had received from HCW.   
 
Participants expressed the need for increasing com-
munity awareness and understanding of PMTCT 
services as a greater concern; although not priori-
tized, the eMTCT plan does also recognize this need.  
National strategies to improve awareness include 
increasing media messages, male involvement, and 
the use of Health Extension Workers (HEW) and the 
Health Development Army (HDA) [6]. Some study 
participants agreed that increased media education 
may promote awareness, but none of the women sug-
gested that engaging males would improve PMTCT 
retention. Considering other studies which strongly 
indicate male support to be a key facilitator to 
PMTCT use [14,26], the omission of this suggestion 
by the participants is notable and should be more 
explicitly explored. Further, although they did not 
refute the use of HEW and HDA, women advised 
that engaging PLWHIV mothers in promoting aware-
ness and education would be more valuable. Expec-
tations that health workers alone can increase aware-
ness and provide consistent support to PLWHIV 
women are optimistic at best when considering their 
already heavy workloads. 
 
Results from this study suggest that the PLWHIV 
mothers are very interested in becoming involved in 
helping to reduce MTCT of HIV. Specifically, 
women desire to be voices of hope and encourage-
ment to their peers through counsel, to serve as mod-
els for medication adherence and healthy lifestyles, 
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 and to share what they have learned with others as 
educators. The value of involving PLWHIV in peer 
support groups and actively engaging PLWHIV as 
peer educators and counselors is being increasingly 
recognized in other sub-Saharan African countries, 
with successful interventions documenting increased 
PMTCT adherence, improved infant health out-
comes, and up to 95% HIV- delivery rates [11, 27-
29]. These successes and our study findings suggest 
that the involvement of PLWHIV mothers should be 
much greater than what is currently being recom-
mended.   
 
Previously several successful Mother Support 
Groups were started in Ethiopia [30] and PLWHIV 
peer counselor programs were run through local 
NGOs. However, due to financial constraints, these 
programs have been sporadically sustained, with 
most no longer active: this further supports the criti-
cal need to capitalize upon the high level of motiva-
tion for involvement expressed among PLWHIV 
mothers in Ethiopia. PLWHIV peer educators and 
counselors can effectively address the most influen-
tial barriers to PMTCT adherence highlighted in the 
study. 
 
The potential impact of this peer support is widely 
supported in the chronic disease literature prevalent 
in the US and other developed nations [31-32].  
These same peer support principles also have the 
implication for effect in low resource areas, allowing 
women to provide hope and positive reinforcement 
that can translate to behavior change [31,33]. Particu-
larly, PLWHIV models who are adhering to a medi-
cation regimen and living a healthy lifestyle can be 
sources of encouragement who help women to over-
come hopelessness and to be more attentive to caring 
for themselves.  Further, women in the study ex-
pressed that focusing on their children inspired hope 
and gave them strength to continue taking their medi-
cation. Thus, PLWHIV peers with healthy children 
can serve as living reminders of the possibility for 
delivering babies born free of HIV.    
 
Results from this study suggest that a general failure 
to understand the benefit of ARV treatment either for 
a mother or her child remains a significant concern.  
Thus, while educational campaigns in Ethiopia have 
succeeded in promoting a high level of awareness of 
HIV and MTCT among the female population 
[13,34], it appears that a comprehensive understand-
ing of the value of PMTCT services has not been 
reached.  As the country rolls out Option B+, a more 
simplistic regimen hoped to promote higher levels of 
adherence; it may be an ideal time to incorporate 

PLWHIV as peer educators in health clinics, commu-
nities, religious institutions, and the media. By tar-
geting their messages to an understanding of how 
ARVs can both prevent infant HIV infection and also 
benefit a woman’s health, the teaching and support of 
PLWHIV peers can  help women to overcome the 
confusion about ARVs that prevents PMTCT adher-
ence.  
 
The concern over the use of holy water expressed in 
this study is significant, and it is clear that education 
encouraging medication adherence along with faith 
practices is needed within the Orthodox Church.  
Interviews with PLWHIV elsewhere have indicated 
that engaging faith leaders in HIV issues can have 
significant positive impacts [35]; religious leaders 
have also been proven able to positively affect mater-
nal health [6,36]. Priests should play an important 
role in providing teaching about holy water, but their 
ability to reach women individually may be limited 
by time constraints. Orthodox PLWHIV peer coun-
selors could provide important additional personal 
support and enhance the education given in the 
church. 
 
The difficulties expressed in the study of living 
jointly with HIV and in poverty are consistent with 
other studies completed in sub-Saharan Africa 
[12,14]. Poverty and poor health are often linked; 
poverty both directly limits access to health care and 
indirectly limits access to prevention education [37]. 
Direct provision of food, housing, and other material 
aid must be addressed at a government level, but 
PLWHIV can play a role in addressing poverty, as 
well. Through starting and managing self-help 
groups, utilizing micro-loan models, and engaging 
with innovative new methods they design, PLWHIV 
mentors may be able to provide economic empower-
ment for their peers [38]. These strategies have been 
recommended as an important part of global HIV 
prevention (Interagency Task Team [39]. 
 
Existing national anti-discrimination laws are in-
tended to promote equitable access to treatment and 
support for PLWHIV, but stronger enforcement and 
better legal retribution for discrimination is needed 
from the government [10].  PLWHIV can also play a 
role in fighting discrimination. Engaging more 
PLWHIV women as community educators and mem-
bers of community planning committees may pro-
mote increased HIV awareness and help to mitigate 
the effects of stigma in these locations. PLWHIV 
women who were previously involved in mother 
support groups also reported that their own fear of 
social stigma decreased with participation [30].   
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 PLWHIV women are being effectively utilized in the 
PMTCT healthcare workforce in order to prevent 
attrition in a number of countries [40].  Not only can 
they provide individual and group counseling to 
PLWHIV mothers at the clinic level, but PLWHIV 
workers can promote linkages to health care systems 
through home based visits and provide default trac-
ing for women who have dropped out of PMTCT 
care.  The highly motivated PLWHIV mothers in this 
study could greatly extend the reach of the current 
PMTCT system if engaged as part of the workforce. 
In addition, although not expressly discussed in this 
study, PLWHIV peers may be effective in addressing 
issues beyond attrition that also affect the MTCT 
rate: encouraging the use of institutional delivery and 
advocating for exclusive breastfeeding are examples.  
 
WHO’s Global Health Sector Strategy 2011-2015 
[41] recommends that engaging PLWHIV in plan-
ning interventions is essential for their success, and 
UNAIDS and PEPFAR support the incorporation of 
PLWHIV in developing HIV/AIDS care and preven-
tion strategies [16,18,42]. In light of such strong in-
ternational recommendations, the advice given by 
women in this study to engage PLWHIV mothers 
should not be overlooked.  Current efforts to improve 
the quality of PMTCT services and the utilization of 
HEW and HDA to promote awareness may improve 
uptake and retention in the PMTCT system. The po-
tential impact of such programs, however, should be 
reconsidered in light of the significant findings of 
this study. Giving greater attention to the use of 
PLWHIV mothers at a system wide level, investing 
in their training as educators and counselors, and 
developing designated PLWHIV peer support pro-
grams may result in markedly greater improvement 
in PMTCT adherence and better infant health out-
comes in the future.  
 
Limitations: Cultural misunderstandings are inherent 
limitations to any international study, but the in-
volvement of a multi-national research team and 
close communication with a local research assistant 
sought to minimize these barriers. The choice to have 
the primary investigator conduct interviews in Eng-
lish with translation expedited the study’s comple-
tion, yet also presents the potential for inaccurate 
translation. However, training and consistent evalua-
tive discussion with the local research assistant who 
translated each interview minimized this concern. 
Use of this local research assistant during both inter-
views and focus groups also enhanced the trust of 
participants, but the possibility remains that per-
ceived power barriers between the research team and 
the participants may have limited their total transpar-

ency. Although study participants often recounted 
their own experiences, they also described the ex-
periences of others. To minimize inaccuracies in 
such secondary data, the plausibility of findings was 
checked by reporting them back to participants, as 
well as using both focus groups and interviews in 
data collection. Confidentiality concerns were mini-
mized by holding research sessions at the program 
offices rather than in the communities. Research bias 
during the design of the study, data collection, or 
data analysis was possible but limited by several col-
laborating researchers giving oversight in this area.  
Although the results of the study may inform future 
research efforts in other locations, they should only 
be interpreted for women in Addis Ababa and not be 
generalized to the rural population of Ethiopia nor 
other locations.  Many factors affect the high rate of 
vertical HIV transmission in Ethiopia, and it must 
also be noted that this study only represents the opin-
ions of PLWHIV mothers on the specific problem of 
lack of adherence to PMTCT care. It does not ad-
dress issues such as low uptake of ANC services or 
low institutional delivery rates. 
 
Conclusion: Maintaining the motivation required to 
adhere to the entire PMTCT cascade requires that a 
PLWHIV mother both understands the validity of the 
steps she is taking and receives support for the many 
challenges she faces. Making sure these requirements 
are met should be the primary target of any future 
interventions if the goal of reducing the MTCT to 
less than 5% in Ethiopia in 2015 is to be met.  Ac-
cording to the advice of PLWHIV mothers given in 
this study, programs should target educational efforts 
toward better understanding of the benefit of ARVs 
and interventions should be designed that help 
PLWHIV mothers overcome a feeling of hopeless-
ness. These difficulties and several others, could be 
mitigated by the use of PLWHIV peers. Strong con-
sideration should be given to investing in training 
and engaging PLWHIV peers as active members of 
the health care workforce and significantly expand-
ing their use in the communities as educators and 
counselors. Doing so will allow the expressed needs 
of the PLWHIV population to be met more effec-
tively and result in a decrease of attrition from 
PMTCT care.  
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